
Willowbank Gardens, Tadworth



£585,000

• Entrance hall with cloakroom

• Modern fitted kitchen

• Good size sitting room

• Spacious adjoining conservatory

• Master bedroom with ensuite

• Two further bedrooms

• Modern family bathroom

• Double glazing and gas central heating

• Garage and driveway

• Landscaped rear garden

Freehold

A very attractive flint fronted three bedroom end
of terrace house presented in excellent order
throughout and including modern fitted kitchen
with appliances, modern bathroom and ensuite
shower room and good size conservatory. Rear
garden and single garage.

Located in a delightful courtyard setting within a
sought after modem development built by Charles
Church in 1996.

The well presented accommodation comprises:
Entrance hall with storage cupboard and
downstairs cloakroom, modern fitted kitchen with
integrated appliances, spacious sitting room with

further storage and adjoining good size
conservatory overlooking the rear garden.

The first floor has Master bedroom with
wardrobes and modern ensuite shower room, two
further bedrooms and fitted family bathroom.

The property has its own driveway and single
garage and further parking for several cars.

To the rear there is an attractive easily maintained
landscaped garden.

Ideally located within a few minutes walk of
Tadworth village with its excellent local shops,

restaurants, cafes and train station with direct link
to London Bridge.

There are well regarded schools within the village
and acres of open countryside on nearby Epsom
Downs And Walton Heath.

The nearby A217 affords easy access to larger
town and the M25 at junction 8.

Viewing recommended.

Tenure - Freehold
Council tax band - E










